



Sales Quote

INDUSTRIAL BUSINESS INTL CORP

1580 Sawgrass Corporate Parkway

Suite 130, Sunrise, FL 33323

Tel: 954-302-3187, 315-4781

Fax: 954-838-7746

E-mail: ibicorp@intech-ie.com

Tax Certificate No. 16-8012998465-1

Quote #**IBI-2024-0039****Date:**May 02nd, 2024**Customer ID**

6600061446

Bill To:**PETROCEDENO, S.A.****RIF: J-29531871-5**Domicilio Fiscal Av. Libertador con Calle El
Empalme, Edif. Petroleos de Venezuela, Torre
Oeste, Piso 7, Of. 28, Urb. La Campina, Caracas,
Distrito Capital, Zona Postal 1050.

Tlfn: N/D

Attn: Ing. Cristy Hernandez (Gerencia de
Ingenieria de Costos, Petrocedeno, S.A.)

Correo: hernandezckx@petrocedeno.pdvs.com

Ship To:El material se enviará al almacén/broker del
cliente PETROCEDENO, S.A., Edo. Anzoátegui
- Venezuela.

Your #	Our #	Sales Rep	Incoterms - DDP	SHIP VIA	Terms	Validity
Budgetary	IBI-2023- 0091/EXC	S. Mendez	VEN	Pick up	Ver abajo	30 days

Item	Qty	Units	Description	Unit Pr (EUR€)	Total (EUR€)
1	25	Box	GAS DETECTOR TYPE TUBE FOR SHORTTIME MEASUREMENTS HYDROGEN SULFIDE 100/a 100-2,000 PPM, DRÄGER PN CH29101	232.00	5,800.00
2	25	Box	GAS DETECTOR TYPE TUBE FOR SHORTTIME MEASUREMENTS HYDRPGEN SULFIDE 0.2%/a 0.2-7 VOL-%, DRÄGER PN CH28101	255.00	6,375.00
3	25	Box	GAS DETECTOR TYPE TUBE FOR SHORTTIME MEASUREMENTS HYDRPGEN SULFIDE 100/a 100-2,000 PPM, DRÄGER PN CH29101	232.00	5,800.00
19	2	Pc	SILICONE VISCOSITY STANDARD AP RT50 600ML 55/50 mPas AT 20/25°C, ANTON PAAR PN 191084	299.00	598.00
20	10	Pc	VISCOSITY STANDARD DKD 100 AW 100ML – 87 / 35 / 6.3 mPas, ANTON PAAR PN 301349	440.00	4,400.00
22	2	Pc	T-CAL TURBIDITY STANDARD, 200 NTU 125 ML, LOVIBOND PN 48011612	111.00	222.00
38	2	Pc	NO BID NOTA: DESCONTINUADO	NO BID	NO BID
39	2	Pc	NO BID NOTA: DESCONTINUADO	NO BID	NO BID
40	2	Pc	NO BID NOTA: DESCONTINUADO	NO BID	NO BID

41	2	Pc	CAN/DEVICENET TERMINATING RESISTOR, 5-POLES FOR LDC, ANTON PAAR PN 83999	54.00	108.00
42	2	Pc	FAN 60x60x25 24VDC FOR LAB PRODUCTIVITY SYSTEMS, ANTON PAAR PN 92947	147.00	294.00
43	2	Pc	NO BID NOTA: DESCONTINUADO	NO BID	NO BID
44	2	Pc	SPS II BOARD FOR LDC, ANTON PAAR PN 2684	2,582.00	5,164.00
45	2	Pc	VIAL 12 ML GLASS PACK WITH 100 PCS FOR LDC, ANTON PAAR PN 94194 Normal part for lab density and concentration available for DMA series, XSAMPLE 530/520 and modulyzers.	184.00	368.00
46	2	Pc	CAP TPE, HIGH TEMPERATURE FOR 12 ML VIAL FOR LAB PRUCTIVITY SYSTEMS, ANTON PAAR PN 92970	429.00	858.00
47	2	Pc	NO BID NOTA: DESCONTINUADO	NO BID	NO BID
48	2	Pc	FUSE 5 x 20 mm AC 250 V, T 5 A H FOR LDC, ANTON PAAR PN 27656	24.00	48.00
49	2	Pc	FLUID SENSOR FOR LAB PRODUCTIVITY SYSTEMS, ANTON PAAR PN 47720	1,206.00	2,412.00
50	2	Pc	NO BID NOTA: DESCONTINUADO	NO BID	NO BID
51	2	Pc	MICRO SWITCH FOR LAB PRUDUCTIVITY SYSTEMS EQUIPMENT, ANTON PAAR PN 79524	96.00	192.00
52	2	Pc	HEATED NEEDLE AND HOSE FOR XSAMPLE 352 H / 452 H, ANTON PAAR PN 92949	3,186.00	6,372.00
53	5	Pc	SMD FUSE 3, 15AF FOR LAB PRODUCTIVITY SYSTEMS, ANTON PAAR PN 17833	26.00	130.00
54	2	Pc	CAN INTERFACE CABLA 0.6M FOR LDC, ANTON PAAR PN 84665	65.00	130.00
55	2	Pc	CONNECTION CABLA HEATING CONTROLLER FOR XSAMPLE, ANTON PAAR PN 91300	557.00	1,114.00
56	2	Pc	CONNECTION CABLE HEATING CONTROLLER FOR LAB PRODUCTIVITY SYSTEMS, ANTON PAAR PN 91301	626.00	1,252.00
57	2	Pc	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID



			NOTA: DESCONTINUADO		
58	4	Pc	CATHODE SOLUTION CELL FOR MOISTURE ANALYZER, KAM CONTROLS PN 09063	5,019.00	20,076.00
59	4	Pc	GENERATOR SOLUTION CELL FOR MOISTURE ANALYZER, KAM CONTROLS PN 09062	3,571.00	14,284.00
60	2	Pc	DETECTOR ELECTRODE FOR MOISTURE ANALYZER, KAM CONTROLS PN 09064	2,558.00	5,116.00
61	5	Pc	RUBBER SEPTUM, 100 PER PACK, KAM CONTROLS PN 09029	274.00	1,370.00
62	2	Pc	NEEDLE, 19 GAUGE 4" LONG, KAM CONTROLS PN 09002	225.00	450.00
63	2	Pc	NEEDLE, 14 GAUGE 4" LONG, KAM CONTROLS PN 09003	244.00	488.00
64	2	Pc	AC POWER PLUG, 110 VAC, KAM CONTROLS PN 370400 **BEFORE PART NUMBER 09024	193.00	386.00
65	2	Pc	SAMPLE INJECTION PORT FOR MOISTURE ANALYZER, KAM CONTROL PN 09049	193.00	386.00
66	2	Pc	KAM KF RECHARGEABLE BATTERY, 12 VDC, KAM CONTROLS PN 370420	454.00	908.00
69	45	Pc	ESSENTIALS THINTOUCH POEDER-FREE BLUE DISPOSABLE NITRILE GLOVES, SIZE SMALL 100 PER BOX, COLE PARMER PN EW-15957-64	30.00	1,350.00
70	45	Pc	ESSENTIALS THINTOUCH POEDER-FREE BLUE DISPOSABLE NITRILE GLOVES, SIZE MEDIUM 100 PER BOX, COLE PARMER PN EW-15957-65	30.00	1,350.00
71	45	Pc	ESSENTIALS THINTOUCH POEDER-FREE BLUE DISPOSABLE NITRILE GLOVES, SIZE LARGE 100 PER BOX, COLE PARMER PN EW-15957-66	30.00	1,350.00
72	45	Pc	ESSENTIALS THINTOUCH POEDER-FREE BLUE DISPOSABLE NITRILE GLOVES, SIZE X-LARGE 100 PER BOX, COLE PARMER PN EW-15957-67	30.00	1,350.00
81	60	Pc	SILICA HR CITRIC ACID F10 PILLOWS TYPE, 100 PER PACK, LOVIBOND PN 531710	62.00	3,720.00
98	25	Pc	DPD FREE, F10 FREE CHLORINE REAGENT PP 100 PER PACK, LOVIBOND PN 530180	54.00	1,350.00
104	20	Pc	SILICA HR REAGENT SET, F10 100 TEST PER PACK, LOVIBOND	184.00	3,680.00

			PN 535700		
105	4	Pc	GASTIGHT SYRINGE, 1.0 ML, KAM CONTROLS PN 09008	454.00	1,816.00
106	4	Pc	RUBBER SEPTUM, 100 PER PACK, KAM CONTROLS PN 09029	258.00	1,032.00
107	6	Pc	DETECTOR ELECTRODE FOR MOISTURE ANALYZER, KAM CONTROLS PN 09064	2,621.00	15,726.00
108	10	Pc	GENERATOR SOLUTION CELL FOR MOISTURE ANALYZER, KAM CONTROLS PN 09062	3,665.00	36,650.00
109	10	Pc	CATHODE SOLUTION CELL FOR MOISTURE ANALYZER, KAM CONTROLS PN 09063	5,114.00	51,140.00
111	40	Pc	PH INDICATOR STRIPS, 0 TO 14, 100 TEST PER KIT, OAKTON PN EW-35850-02 -Vivid and easy-to-distinguish colors at every pH interval -0 to 14 pH in 1 pH unit increments	70.00	2,800.00
112	6	Pc	GASTIGHT SYRINGE, 250 UL, KAM CONTROLS PN 09021	423.00	2,538.00
113	6	Pc	GASTIGHT SYRINGE, 500 UL, KAM CONTROLS PN 09022	458.00	2,748.00
114	2	Pc	TBD	TBD	TBD
115	4,080	Pc	TRANSPARENT GLASS BOTTLE FOR LABORATORY SAMPLE, GL45 CAP SIZE, CAPACITY 1000 ML, BURKLE PN EW-06041-30	64.00	261,120.00
117	24	Pc	DPD FREE, F10 FREE CHLORINE REAGENT PP 100 PER PACK, LOVIBOND PN 531080	54.00	1,296.00
			Delivery Time Luego de recibir orden de compra y pago, Items 1-3, 19, 20, 22, 41, 42, 44-46, 48, 49, 51-56, 69-72, 81, 98, 104, 111, 115, 117: 4-6 semanas aprox. Item 58-66, 105-109, 112, 113: 5-7 semanas aprox. El tiempo de entrega de los elementos ofertados queda sujeto a cambios generados por eventos fuera de manejo de la compañía como: 1. Fenómenos climáticos que no permitan el transporte de materia prima a la fábrica, transporte local en el extranjero del material manufacturado y/o transporte internacional del producto. 2. Normal funcionamiento de aduana Venezolana y/o extranjeras. 3. Alteración del orden público en el país de origen, país en tránsito y/o país final. 4. Actos delictivos y/o terroristas. 5. Cualquier otro evento considerado de fuerza mayor. Payment terms		

**INDUSTRIAL BUSINESS INTL CORP**

1580 Sawgrass Corporate Parkway

Suite 130, Sunrise, FL 33323

Tel: 954-302-3187, 315-4781

Fax: 954-838-7746

E-mail: ibicorp@intech-ie.com

		100 % Prepagado con orden de compra		
		Volume & Weight Peso y volumen por notificar		

PLEASE TRANSFER TO OUR**ACCOUNT AT:**

Branch Banking & Trust Co.

450 North Pine Island

Plantation, FL 33324

Account #: 0140953040

ABA# 053-101-121

Routing/Transit Number: 2631-9138-7

Swift Code: BRBTUS33

THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS

Subtotal	EUR €	476,117.00
Freight	EUR	Included
Insurance	EUR	Included
Docs.	EUR	Included
TOTAL	EUR	480,016.00